
Class Descriptions 
Outer Space- the Place for Art! 
 
Ages 4-6 
 
Martian Masterpieces-  How fun it is to create art with Space Exploration in mind? Galaxies, 
Astronauts, and exciting Spaceships are all possible subjects. A variety of media will be used. 
 
The Night Sky-.Embark on an artistic journey through the cosmos in this class focused on 
capturing the beauty and mystery of the night sky. Young artists will create planets, moons, and 
much more! 
 
Drawing and Painting Rocket- Blast off into the world of rockets! Students will practice 
various drawing skills to create their colorful rockets.  
 
Ages 7+ 
 
Paper Mache Spaceships- Come design and construct your very own spaceship in paper mache. 
This class is great for students who love to build and find new purposes for the materials around 
them. Students will learn much about design and construction! 
 
Creative Cosmos- This class will be working on copies of Chesley Bonestell’s influential outer 
space illustrations. Students will be guided through using tempera, watercolor, and oil pastels to 
create modern space art! 
 
Stuffies in Space-  In this imaginative class, students will learn how to design and make their 
very own puppets! Using a variety of materials like fabric, yarn, buttons, and sticks, students will 
create unique puppet characters from scratch. They’ll learn basic sewing, gluing, and decorating 
techniques to bring their puppet ideas to life, from funny faces to whimsical creatures. 
 
Cartooning: Superheroes in Space- Welcome to the multiverse! Come create comics based on 
your favorite superheroes or create your own from another planet in space. Students will learn 
techniques in drawing, inking, and lettering.  
 
StarWars Cartooning- Create fun comics and comic-style art based on your favorite Star Wars 
characters. Create a comic page or scene featuring your choice of characters, as you learn 
techniques in drawing, inking, and lettering. All materials included. 
 
 
 



 
 
Ages 10+ 
 
Tile Painting- In this class students will start building their own tiles out of white clay. 
Afterwards,  they will take time to design their own unique tile paintings. This class is mostly 
focused on techniques to create building painting on clay using underglazes.  
 
Out of this World Paper Quilling- Come quill with us! Quilling is an art form that involves the 
use of strips of paper that are rolled, shaped, and glued together to create decorative designs. 
These colorful, dynamic pieces are a show-stopper! 
 
Stop Motion Alien Edition- Learn how to make your own stop motion animations! Students 
will design and create their own articulated paper dolls, props, and storyline to film a short stop 
motion video. Perfect for budding writers and filmmakers! 


